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The Conversion Accounts of the Apostle Paul 

Acts 9:1–22 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

[1] But Saul, still breathing 
threats and murder against the 
disciples of the Lord, went to the 
high priest 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
[2] and asked him for letters to the 
synagogues at Damascus, so that if 
he found any belonging to the 
Way, men or women, he might 
bring them bound to Jerusalem. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
[3] Now as he went on his way, 

he approached Damascus, and 
suddenly a light from heaven 
shone around him. 

 

Acts 22:3–21 
 

[3] “I am a Jew, born in 
Tarsus in Cilicia, but brought up in 
this city, educated at the feet of 
Gamaliel according to the strict 
manner of the law of our fathers, 
being zealous for God as all of you 
are this day. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
[4] I persecuted this Way to the 
death, binding and delivering to 
prison both men and women, 
[5] as the high priest and the 
whole council of elders can bear 
me witness. From them I received 
letters to the brothers, and I 
journeyed toward Damascus to 
take those also who were there 
and bring them in bonds to 
Jerusalem to be punished. 

 
 
 
 
 
[6] “As I was on my way and 

drew near to Damascus, about 
noon a great light from heaven 
suddenly shone around me. 

Acts 26:4–20 

[4] “My manner of life 
from my youth, spent from the 
beginning among my own nation 
and in Jerusalem, is known by all 
the Jews. [5] They have known for 
a long time, if they are willing to 
testify, that according to the 
strictest party of our religion I 
have lived as a Pharisee. [6] And 
now I stand here on trial because 
of my hope in the promise made 
by God to our fathers, 7 to which 
our twelve tribes hope to attain, 
as they earnestly worship night 
and day. And for this hope I am 
accused by Jews, O king! [8] Why 
is it thought incredible by any of 
you that God raises the dead?  

[9] “I myself was 
convinced that I ought to do many 
things in opposing the name of 
Jesus of Nazareth. [10] And I did so 
in Jerusalem. I not only locked up 
many of the saints in prison after 
receiving authority from the chief 
priests, but when they were put to 
death I cast my vote against them. 
[11] And I punished them often in 
all the synagogues and tried to 
make them blaspheme, and in 
raging fury against them I 
persecuted them even to foreign 
cities. 

[12] “In this connection I 
journeyed to Damascus with the 
authority and commission of the 
chief priests. [13] At midday, O 
king, I saw on the way a light from 
heaven, brighter than the sun, that 
shone around me and those who 
journeyed with me. 
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[4] And falling to the ground, he 
heard a voice saying to him, “Saul, 
Saul, why are you persecuting 
me?” [5] And he said, “Who are 
you, Lord?” And he said, “I am 
Jesus, whom you are persecuting. 

 
 

 
 
 
 
[6] But rise and enter the city, and 
you will be told what you are to 
do.” [7] The men who were 
traveling with him stood 
speechless, hearing the voice but 
seeing no one. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
[8] Saul rose from the ground, and 
although his eyes were opened, he 
saw nothing. So they led him by 
the hand and brought him into 
Damascus. [9] And for three days 
he was without sight, and neither 
ate nor drank.  
 

Acts 22:3–21 
 

[7] And I fell to the ground and 
heard a voice saying to me, ‘Saul, 
Saul, why are you persecuting 
me?’ [8] And I answered, ‘Who are 
you, Lord?’ And he said to me, ‘I 
am Jesus of Nazareth, whom you 
are persecuting.’ [9] Now those 
who were with me saw the light 
but did not understand the voice 
of the one who was speaking to 
me. [10] And I said, ‘What shall I 
do, Lord?’ And the Lord said to 
me, ‘Rise, and go into Damascus, 
and there you will be told all that 
is appointed for you to do.’ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
[11] And since I could not see 
because of the brightness of that 
light, I was led by the hand by 
those who were with me, and 
came into Damascus. 

Acts 26:4–20 

[14] And when we had all 
fallen to the ground, I heard a 
voice saying to me in the Hebrew 
language, ‘Saul, Saul, why are you 
persecuting me? It is hard for you 
to kick against the goads.’ [15] And 
I said, ‘Who are you, Lord?’ And 
the Lord said, ‘I am Jesus whom 
you are persecuting. 
 
 
 
 
[16] But rise and stand upon your 
feet, for I have appeared to you 
for this purpose, to appoint you as 
a servant and witness to the things 
in which you have seen me and to 
those in which I will appear to you, 
[17] delivering you from your 
people and from the Gentiles—to 
whom I am sending you [18] to 
open their eyes, so that they may 
turn from darkness to light and 
from the power of Satan to God, 
that they may receive forgiveness 
of sins and a place among those 
who are sanctified by faith in me.’ 

[19] “Therefore, O King 
Agrippa, I was not disobedient to 
the heavenly vision, 20 but 
declared first to those in 
Damascus, then in Jerusalem and 
throughout all the region of Judea, 
and also to the Gentiles, that they 
should repent and turn to God, 
performing deeds in keeping with 
their repentance. 
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[10] Now there was a disciple at 
Damascus named Ananias. The 
Lord said to him in a vision, 
“Ananias.” And he said, “Here I 
am, Lord.” [11] And the Lord said 
to him, “Rise and go to the street 
called Straight, and at the house of 
Judas look for a man of Tarsus 
named Saul, for behold, he is 
praying, [12] and he has seen in a 
vision a man named Ananias come 
in and lay his hands on him so that 
he might regain his sight.” [13] But 
Ananias answered, “Lord, I have 
heard from many about this man, 
how much evil he has done to 
your saints at Jerusalem. [14] And 
here he has authority from the 
chief priests to bind all who call on 
your name.” [15] But the Lord said 
to him, “Go, for he is a chosen 
instrument of mine to carry my 
name before the Gentiles and 
kings and the children of Israel. 
[16] For I will show him how much 
he must suffer for the sake of my 
name.”[17] So Ananias departed 
and entered the house. And laying 
his hands on him he said, “Brother 
Saul, the Lord Jesus who appeared 
to you on the road by which you 
came has sent me so that you may 
regain your sight and be filled with 
the Holy Spirit.” 

Acts 22:3–21 

[12] “And one Ananias, a devout 
man according to the law, well 
spoken of by all the Jews who 
lived there, 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
[13] came to me, and standing by 
me said to me, ‘Brother Saul, 
receive your sight.’ And at that 
very hour I received my sight and 
saw him. 14 And he said, ‘The God 
of our fathers appointed you to 
know his will, to see the Righteous 
One and to hear a voice from his 
mouth; [15] for you will be a 
witness for him to everyone of 
what you have seen and heard. 
[16] And now why do you wait? 
Rise and be baptized and wash 
away your sins, calling on his 
name.’ 

Acts 26:4–20 
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[17] “When I had returned to 
Jerusalem and was praying in the 
temple, I fell into a trance [18] and 
saw him saying to me, ‘Make haste 
and get out of Jerusalem quickly, 
because they will not accept your 
testimony about me.’ [19] And I 
said, ‘Lord, they themselves know 
that in one synagogue after 
another I imprisoned and beat 
those who believed in you. 
[20] And when the blood of 
Stephen your witness was being 
shed, I myself was standing by and 
approving and watching over the 
garments of those who killed him.’ 
[21] And he said to me, ‘Go, for I 
will send you far away to the 
Gentiles.’” 
 

Acts 9:1–22 

[18] And immediately something 
like scales fell from his eyes, and 
he regained his sight. Then he rose 
and was baptized; [19] and taking 
food, he was strengthened. 
For some days he was with the 
disciples at Damascus. [20] And 
immediately he proclaimed Jesus 
in the synagogues, saying, “He is 
the Son of God.” [21] And all who 
heard him were amazed and said, 
“Is not this the man who made 
havoc in Jerusalem of those who 
called upon this name? And has he 
not come here for this purpose, to 
bring them bound before the chief 
priests?” [22] But Saul increased 
all the more in strength, and 
confounded the Jews who lived in 
Damascus by proving that Jesus 
was the Christ. 
 

Acts 26:4–20 

 

 

 


